
Bid Item #12-066

Warehouse Inventory Supplies

for the City of Augusta - Utilities Department

Bid Due:  Wednesday, November 9, 2011 @ 11:00 a.m.

WAREHOUSE - WYLDS ROAD

Toole Supply

1605 Hartrich Rd

Augusta, GA 30909

E T Industrial Supply

P. O. Box 9201

Augusta, GA 30916

HD Supply 

Waterworks

3620 Milledgeville Rd

Augusta, GA 30909

Independent 

Waterworks

221 Laurel Road

Lexington, SC 29073

Consolidated Pipe

1241 Fairgrounds 

Madison, GA 30650

Atlantic Supply

1628 Barton Chapel 

Rd

Augusta, GA 30909

Ferguson 

Waterworks

702 McKnight 

Industrial

Augusta, GA 30907

Homeland

214 Florida Ave

New Smyrna Bea, FL 

32169

Attachment B Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

E-Verify Number 277078 297601 19959 ASEI1240 189824 306023 261662 273942

 UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE 

 UNIT

 PRICE 

 UNIT

PRICE 

 UNIT

PRICE 

 UNIT

PRICE 

 UNIT

PRICE  UNIT PRICE 

1 1" Corporation Stop FB 600-4
No Bid No Bid $30.24 $36.95 No Bid $29.28 $33.91 No Bid

2

2" Corporation Stop, FB 500-

7
No Bid No Bid $102.44 $139.52 No Bid $99.23 $114.84 No Bid

3 3/4" Ford Ball BL11-233 W No Bid No Bid $17.92 $20.70 No Bid $17.37 $20.08 No Bid

4 3/4" Curb Stop B11-333 W No Bid No Bid $26.90 $32.86 No Bid $26.06 $30.15 No Bid

5 3/4" Curb Stop B41-333 W.G.
No Bid No Bid $30.24 $36.95 No Bid $29.29 $33.91 No Bid

6 1" Curb Stop B11-444 W No Bid No Bid $41.21 $50.36 No Bid $39.93 $46.21 No Bid

7 1" Curb Stop B41-444 W.G. No Bid No Bid $45.89 $56.07 No Bid $44.45 $51.44 No Bid

8

3/4" Service Elbow Comp/MIP 

Thread L84-33 G
No Bid No Bid $8.25 $10.07 No Bid $7.97 $9.24 No Bid

9

1" Service Elbow Comp/MIP 

Thread L84-44 G

No Bid No Bid $13.72 $16.75 No Bid $13.28 $15.37 No Bid

10

3/4" Copper to Iron 

Compression C84-33 G
No Bid No Bid $7.52 $9.20 No Bid $7.29 $8.43 No Bid

11

1" Copper to Iron 

Compression C84-44 G
No Bid No Bid $8.92 $10.89 No Bid $8.63 $9.99 No Bid

12

3/4" Copper to Copper 

Compression/Compression 

C44-33 G
No Bid No Bid $9.16 $11.20 No Bid $8.87 $10.27 No Bid

13

1" Copper to Copper 

Compression/Compression 

C44-44 G

No Bid No Bid $10.49 $12.82 No Bid $10.15 $11.75 No Bid

14

3/4" Female Iron Pipe x 1" 

Male Iron Pipe C18-34
No Bid No Bid $2.33 $2.21 No Bid $2.60 $2.62 No Bid

15

3/4' Curb Stop Flare B21-

333W. No Bid No Bid $31.61 $38.64 No Bid $30.64 $35.43 No Bid

16

1'' Swivel Nut (Female Flare 

Nut Thread) X CTS 4476S-22

No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.08 No Bid $20.62 No Bid No Bid

17

1 1/2" Ball Valve F x F  B11-

666
No Bid No Bid $75.18 $93.16 No Bid $72.83 $84.28 No Bid

18 2” Ball Valve B11-777 No Bid No Bid $109.95 $135.64 No Bid $106.51 $123.27 No Bid

19 3/4" PVC Coupling Sch #40 No Bid No Bid $0.24 $0.12 $0.18 $0.18 $0.12 No Bid

20 1" PVC Coupling Sch #40 No Bid No Bid $0.43 $0.22 $0.31 $0.30 $0.22 No Bid

21

3/4" PVC Female Adapter Sch 

#40 No Bid No Bid $0.38 $0.20 $0.28 $0.27 $0.20 No Bid

22

4" PVC  Sewer Tee Wye Glue 

x Glue  for 30/34 Pipe 
No Bid No Bid $3.33 $3.21 $3.19 $3.15 $3.77 No Bid

23

4" PVC  Sewer Threaded 

Clean Out Plug for 30/34 Pipe 
No Bid No Bid $1.26 $2.81 $1.22 $1.16 $1.42 No Bid

24

4" PVC  Sewer Female 

Adapter   for 30/34 Pipe
No Bid No Bid $2.08 $2.00 $1.98 $1.95 $2.34 No Bid

25

6" PVC Elbow 45 for 30/34 

Pipe Glue x Glue
No Bid No Bid $6.22 $6.00 $5.94 $5.85 $7.04 No Bid

26

6" PVC Elbow 45 for 30/34 

Pipe Glue x Spigot 
No Bid No Bid $7.94 $7.66 $7.58 $7.45 $8.98 No Bid

27

6" PVC Clean Out w/Plug for 

30/34 Pipe
No Bid No Bid $15.08 $14.21 $15.42 $14.21 $18.28 No Bid

28

6" PVC  Sewer Tee Wye Glue 

x Glue  for 30/34 Pipe
No Bid No Bid $22.86 $22.04 $22.10 $21.50 $34.34 No Bid

29

4" PVC Elbow 45 Glue x 

Spigot for 30/34 Pipe
No Bid No Bid $2.14 $2.06 $2.05 $2.00 $2.42 No Bid

30

6” PVC Elbow 22 1/2” Glue x 

Glue for 30/34 Pipe
No Bid No Bid $7.59 $7.31 $7.24 $7.10 $8.58 No Bid

31

4” PVC Elbow 22 1/2” Glue x 

Glue for 30/34 Pipe No Bid No Bid $1.74 $1.67 $1.66 $1.60 $1.96 No Bid

32
3/4" Meter Coupling (5680 

Hayes or Equal)
No Bid No Bid $4.89 $4.82 No Bid $3.45 $4.26 No Bid

33
3/4" Meter Washer (Rubber)

No Bid No Bid $0.10 No Bid No Bid $0.07 $0.13 No Bid

34 5/8" x 3/4" x 9" Meter Thread 

x Meter Thread 18-209 W. X.

No Bid No Bid $48.98 No Bid No Bid $50.40 $61.19 No Bid

35 5/8 x 3/4" x 12" Meter Thread 

X Meter Thread 18-212 W. X.

No Bid No Bid $50.59 No Bid No Bid $52.06 $63.18 No Bid

36 5/8 x 3/4" x 15" Meter Thread 

X Meter Thread 18-215 W. X.

No Bid No Bid $52.57 No Bid No Bid $54.09 $65.66 No Bid

37
3/4" x 1/32" Fiber Meter 

Washer
No Bid No Bid $0.13 No Bid No Bid $0.05 $0.10 No Bid

Brass Fittings

PVC Fittings

Meter Couplings, Washer and 
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38
1" Meter Coupling (5680 

Hayes or Equal)
No Bid No Bid $7.52 No Bid No Bid $5.40 $7.32 No Bid

39
3/4 to 1 Meter Adapter (AY 

McDonald or Equal)
No Bid No Bid $9.57 No Bid No Bid $4.81 $6.31 No Bid

40

3/4" Galv. Compression 

Coupling (Long Style) 

Dresser

No Bid No Bid $11.09 No Bid $8.35 $4.45 $6.99 No Bid

41

1" Galv. Compression 

Coupling (Long Style) 

Dresser
No Bid No Bid $12.53 No Bid $9.51 $5.88 $9.15 No Bid

42

2" Galv. Compression 

Coupling (Long Style) 

Dresser

No Bid No Bid $18.30 No Bid $18.48 $12.51 $18.25 No Bid

43

3/4" Galv. Compression 

Coupling (Short Style) 

Dresser

No Bid No Bid $16.30 No Bid $10.32 $4.03 $6.99 No Bid

44

1" Galv. Compression 

Coupling (Short Style) 

Dresser

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.43 $5.18 $9.15 No Bid

45

1 1/4" Galv. Compression 

Coupling (Short Style) 

Dresser

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.52 $6.32 $11.26 No Bid

46

1 1/2" Galv. Compression 

Coupling (Short Style) 

Dresser

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.02 $7.62 $14.43 No Bid

47

2" Galv. Compression 

Coupling (Short Style) 

Dresser

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.86 $10.93 $18.25 No Bid

48
1 1/2" X 1" Galv Bell Reducer

No Bid No Bid $2.11 No Bid $1.62 $2.91 $3.43 No Bid

49 1" X 3/4" Galv Bell Reducer No Bid No Bid $1.20 No Bid $1.32 $1.65 $1.94 No Bid

50
1 1/4" X 3/4" Galv Bell 

Reducer
No Bid No Bid $1.64 No Bid $1.58 $2.26 $2.66 No Bid

51 3/4" X 2" Galv. Nipple No Bid No Bid $0.46 No Bid $0.47 $0.55 $0.69 No Bid

52 3/4" X 3" Galv. Nipple No Bid No Bid $0.52 No Bid $0.52 $0.61 $0.77 No Bid

53 3/4" X 5" Galv. Nipple No Bid No Bid $0.79 No Bid $0.80 $0.94 $1.18 No Bid

54 2" X 4" Galv. Nipple No Bid No Bid $1.78 No Bid $1.78 $2.10 $2.65 No Bid

55 2" X 6" Galv. Nipple No Bid No Bid $2.64 No Bid $2.65 $3.11 $3.94 No Bid

56 1" X 6" Galv. Nipple No Bid No Bid $1.25 No Bid $1.26 $1.49 $1.87 No Bid

57 1" X 4" Galv. Nipple No Bid No Bid $0.91 No Bid $0.90 $1.07 $1.34 No Bid

58 2" Galv. All-Thread Nipple No Bid No Bid $1.31 No Bid $2.48 $1.54 $1.94 No Bid

59
6" Dresser (642/768) Hymax 

Coupling   Smith-Blair
No Bid No Bid $157.03 No Bid $161.10 $156.39 $161.98 No Bid

60
8" Dresser (854/984) Hymax 

Coupling   Smith-Blair
No Bid No Bid $190.35 No Bid $196.50 $189.57 $196.35 No Bid

61 10" Dresser (1096/1226) 

Hymax Coupling  Smith-Blair

No Bid No Bid $244.86 No Bid $251.70 $243.86 $252.58 No Bid

62 12" Dresser (1315/1441) 

Hymax Coupling  Smith-Blair

No Bid No Bid $289.03 No Bid $298.95 $287.85 $298.14 No Bid

63
2" Dresser (210/303) Hymax 

Coupling  Smith-Blair
No Bid No Bid $74.40 No Bid $74.84 $74.10 $76.75 No Bid

64
4" Dresser (424/511) Hymax 

Coupling  Smith-Blair
No Bid No Bid $127.31 No Bid $101.05 $126.79 $131.32 No Bid

65
3" Dresser (346/433) Hymax 

Coupling  Smith-Blair
No Bid No Bid $97.03 No Bid $131.50 $96.63 $100.09 No Bid

66
4" Fernco Coupling 4" PVC x 

4" PVC
No Bid No Bid $2.86 No Bid $2.89 $2.80 $3.40 No Bid

67
4" Fernco Coupling 4" Clay x 

4" PVC No Bid No Bid $2.86 No Bid $2.89 $2.80 $3.40 No Bid

68
6" Fernco Coupling 6" Clay x 

4" PVC
No Bid No Bid $6.67 No Bid $6.73 $6.50 $8.55 No Bid

69
6" Fernco Coupling 6" PVC x 

4" PVC
No Bid No Bid $6.67 No Bid $6.73 $6.50 $8.55 No Bid

70
6" Fernco Coupling 6" Clay x 

6" PVC
No Bid No Bid $6.14 $6.20 $6.20 $6.00 $7.29 No Bid

71
6" Fernco Coupling 6" 

Concrete x 6" PVC
No Bid No Bid $6.14 $6.20 $6.20 $6.00 $8.05 No Bid

72
8" Fernco Coupling 8" Clay x 

8" PVC
No Bid No Bid $9.41 $9.51 $9.55 $9.20 $11.21 No Bid

73
6" Fernco Coupling 6" PVC x 

6" PVC
No Bid No Bid $6.14 $6.20 $6.20 $6.00 $7.29 No Bid

74
8" Fernco Coupling 8" 

Concrete x 8" PVC No Bid No Bid $9.41 $9.51 $9.55 $9.20 $12.10 No Bid

75
6" Fernco Coupling 6" 

Concrete x 4" PVC
No Bid No Bid $9.05 $6.20 $8.75 $6.20 $8.55 No Bid

76
12" X 6" Flexible T Saddle 

w/Clamps
No Bid No Bid $30.44 $30.76 $30.85 $29.92 $31.54 No Bid

Fernco Couplings

Galvanized Fittings, Nipples, Comp 

Transition Coupling (Dresser Hymax)
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77

Whole House Water Filter 

(WC34-PR) American 

Plumber

No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.39 No Bid $29.95 No Bid No Bid

78

Whole House Water Filter 

Cartridge(W5CP) American 

Plum
No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.09 No Bid $12.95 No Bid No Bid

79
Valve Box w/tops Slip Type

No Bid No Bid $35.05 $28.66 $38.50 $37.00 $43.95 No Bid

80
6” Concrete Valve Box Pad

No Bid No Bid $11.00 $9.41 $15.00 $9.00 $11.00 No Bid

81
Valve Box Top Section w 

Tops Slip 15"
No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.40 $22.10 $21.00 $17.31 No Bid

82 1" Valve Box Riser No Bid No Bid $7.22 $6.24 $8.00 $7.10 $3.99 No Bid

83 1 1/2" Valve Box Riser No Bid No Bid $8.51 $7.20 $9.25 $8.37 $5.99 No Bid

84 2" Valve Box Riser No Bid No Bid $9.02 $8.24 $9.75 $8.24 $8.99 No Bid

85
Meter Box top w/2" Touch 

Read Hole for Rome Box  No Bid No Bid $31.25 $9.89 $11.25 $9.89 $33.38 No Bid

86
3" x 15" Repair Band (346-

370) Smith-Blair
No Bid No Bid $64.45 $74.76 No Bid $72.46 No Bid No Bid

87
6" x 15" Repair Band (684-

724) Smith-Blair
No Bid No Bid $81.60 $94.65 No Bid $91.75 No Bid No Bid

88
6" x 15" Repair Band (705-

7.45) Smith-Blair 226
No Bid No Bid $82.66 $95.87 No Bid $92.93 No Bid No Bid

89
6” x 15” Repair Band (656-

696) Smith-Blair
No Bid No Bid $77.88 $90.37 No Bid $87.57 No Bid No Bid

90
½” x 3” Handiband Repair 

Band Smith-Blair   244
No Bid No Bid $18.43 $14.21 No Bid $13.77 No Bid No Bid

91
¾” x 3” Handiband Repair 

Band Smith-Blair   244 No Bid No Bid $12.41 $14.40 No Bid $13.95 No Bid No Bid

92
1” x 3”  Handiband Repair 

Band Smith-Blair   244
No Bid No Bid $13.13 $15.23 No Bid $14.76 No Bid No Bid

93
2” x 3”  Handiband Repair 

Band Smith-Blair   244
No Bid No Bid $15.06 $17.47 No Bid $16.93 No Bid No Bid

94
½” x 6” Handiband Repair 

Band Smith-Blair   244
No Bid No Bid $26.10 $30.27 No Bid $29.34 No Bid No Bid

95
¾” x 6” Handiband Repair 

Band Smith-Blair   244
No Bid No Bid $26.24 $30.44 No Bid $29.51 No Bid No Bid

96
1” x 6”  Handiband Repair 

Band Smith-Blair   244
No Bid No Bid $26.44 $30.66 No Bid $29.72 No Bid No Bid

97
2” x 6”  Handiband Repair 

Band Smith-Blair   244
No Bid No Bid $27.98 $32.46 No Bid $31.46 No Bid No Bid

98
6" x 7 1/2" Repair Band (684-

764) Smith-Blair
No Bid No Bid $60.55 $54.87 No Bid $53.19 No Bid No Bid

99
2" x 15" Repair Band (2.35-

2.63) Smith-Blair
No Bid No Bid $56.23 $65.22 No Bid $63.22 No Bid No Bid

100
8” x 15” Repair Band (684-

764) Smith-Blair No Bid No Bid $117.68 $106.64 No Bid $103.37 No Bid No Bid

101
6" M.J. Valve  w/acc Open 

Left 
No Bid No Bid $335.98 $400.74 No Bid $353.00 $343.62 No Bid

102
8" M. J. Valve w/acc Open 

Left 
No Bid No Bid $535.11 $623.37 No Bid $550.00 $546.94 No Bid

103
2" Iron Body Valve w/2" 

Female Thread No Bid No Bid $160.79 $176.62 No Bid $155.84 $164.22 No Bid

104
4" M.J. Valve w/acc (Open 

Right)
No Bid No Bid $281.61 $309.71 No Bid $273.00 $269.10 No Bid

105
6" M.J. Valve w/acc (Open 

Right)
No Bid No Bid $335.98 $400.74 No Bid $353.00 $343.62 No Bid

106
8” M.J. Valve w/acc (Open 

Right)
No Bid No Bid $535.11 $623.37 No Bid $550.00 $546.94 No Bid

107
4” Tapping Valve w/acc 

(Open Right)
No Bid No Bid $351.70 $386.39 No Bid $340.00 $339.48 No Bid

108
Locking Ring and Cover (Bolt 

Down)
No Bid No Bid $196.60 $178.94 No Bid $169.00 $199.00 No Bid

109 1" Manhole Ring Riser 24" No Bid No Bid $65.22 $22.63 No Bid $38.32 $31.00 No Bid

110
1 1/2" Manhole Ring Riser 

24"
No Bid No Bid $75.00 $27.89 No Bid $38.57 $31.00 No Bid

111 2" Manhole Ring Riser 24" No Bid No Bid $80.43 $32.63 No Bid $41.37 $37.45 No Bid

112 6" Cement Grade Ring No Bid No Bid $24.76 $28.42 No Bid $31.50 $29.96 No Bid

113 4" Cement Grade Ring No Bid No Bid $24.76 $22.11 No Bid $22.11 $23.09 No Bid

114 2" Cement Grade Ring No Bid No Bid $24.76 $16.84 No Bid $19.50 $19.35 No Bid

115

6" x 1" CC Tapping 

Saddle(684-7.60) Double 

Strap 

No Bid No Bid $18.92 $22.68 No Bid $21.98 No Bid No Bid

116
8" x 2" IPT Tapping Saddle 

(854-1010) Double Strap 
No Bid No Bid $30.26 $30.89 No Bid $29.94 No Bid No Bid

117
10 x 2 IPT Tapping Saddle 

(1061-1212) Double Strap 
No Bid No Bid $39.92 $40.75 No Bid $39.50 No Bid No Bid

Manhole cover And Rings

M.J. Valves - Open Left

Valve Boxes and Tops

Repair Bands

Tapping Saddles
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118
12 x 1" CC Tapping Saddle 

(1262-1432) Double Strap 
No Bid No Bid $37.62 $38.40 No Bid $37.22 No Bid No Bid

119
8" x 1" CC Tapping Saddle 

(854-1010) Double Strap 
No Bid No Bid $24.26 $24.77 No Bid $24.01 No Bid No Bid

120
10"x 1" CC Tapping Saddle 

(10.64-12.12) Double Strap
No Bid No Bid $31.36 $32.01 No Bid $31.03 No Bid No Bid

121

2 1/2" X 1" CC Tapping 

Saddle (2.44  - 2.97 ) Double 

Strap

No Bid No Bid $14.11 $14.40 No Bid $13.95 No Bid No Bid

122

6" x 1" CC Tapping 

Saddle(684-7.60) Double 

Strap 313

No Bid No Bid $22.22 $22.68 No Bid $21.98 No Bid No Bid

123 2" x 1" CC Tapping Saddle 

(2.35-2.56) Double Strap 313

No Bid No Bid $12.85 $13.12 No Bid $12.71 No Bid No Bid

124 6" x 2" CC Tapping Saddle 

(6.87-7.60) Double Strap 313
No Bid No Bid $27.40 $27.97 No Bid $27.11 No Bid No Bid

125
3/4" Copper Tubing 60' Rolls 

Soft K
No Bid No Bid $4.17 $3.61 No Bid $3.61 $4.05 No Bid

126
3/4" Copper Tubing 100' 

Rolls Soft K
No Bid No Bid $4.17 $3.61 No Bid $3.61 $4.05 No Bid

127
1" Copper Tubing 60' Rolls 

Soft K
No Bid No Bid $5.43 $4.70 No Bid $4.70 $5.24 No Bid

128
1" Copper Tubing 100' Rolls 

Soft K
No Bid No Bid $5.43 $4.70 No Bid $4.70 $5.24 No Bid

129
4" PVC Sewer Pipe 30/34 

x/Lub
No Bid No Bid $1.00 $0.81 No Bid $0.81 $0.91 No Bid

130
6" PVC Sewer Pipe 30/34 

w/Lub
No Bid No Bid $2.05 $1.73 No Bid $1.73 $1.98 No Bid

131
8" PVC Sewer Pipe 30/34 

w/Lub
No Bid No Bid $3.70 $3.11 No Bid $3.11 $3.55 No Bid

132 6” Ductile Pipe Slip Joint No Bid No Bid $13.13 $13.84 No Bid $13.06 $14.28 No Bid

133 8" Ductile Pipe Slip Joint No Bid No Bid $16.39 $17.27 No Bid $16.30 $17.82 No Bid

134 3/4" PVC Pipe SCH 40 No Bid No Bid $0.25 $0.27 No Bid $0.25 $0.33 No Bid

135 1”    PVC Pipe SCH 40 No Bid No Bid $0.65 $0.44 No Bid $0.40 $0.55 No Bid

136
2" Copper Tubing 60' Rolls 

Soft K
No Bid No Bid $14.58 $12.63 No Bid $12.50 $13.98 No Bid

2012

Quanti

ty

Description

137
1 1/2" Copper Tubing 60' 

Rolls Soft K
No Bid No Bid $9.06 $11.95 No Bid $8.50 $8.73 No Bid

138 14" Ductile Iron Water Pipe No Bid No Bid $43.44 $38.56 No Bid $43.44 $47.24 No Bid

139 16" Ductile Iron Water Pipe No Bid No Bid $46.47 $42.58 No Bid $46.47 $50.54 No Bid

140 2" Galvanized Pipe No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.47 No Bid $9.90 $3.12 No Bid

141 W.D. 40 12 oz cans $6.55 $6.00 No Bid $5.45 $6.35 $8.00 $6.86 No Bid

142 AAA Cell Batteries $0.50 $0.80 No Bid $0.47 $0.30 $0.50 $0.41 No Bid

143 AA Cell Batteries $0.50 $0.80 No Bid $1.40 $0.28 $0.50 $0.41 No Bid

144 C Cell Batteries $0.97 $1.25 No Bid $2.01 $0.66 $1.00 $0.61 No Bid

145 D Cell Batteries $1.10 $1.25 No Bid $2.01 $0.79 $1.05 $0.69 No Bid

146 3/4" Hose Bib No Bid No Bid $4.75 $2.83 $4.35 $3.50 $3.29 No Bid

147
3/4" pressure Reducing 

Valve (PRV) Watts
No Bid No Bid $29.38 $24.22 No Bid $28.90 $33.49 No Bid

148
3/4" Gate Valve (Hand) Brass

No Bid No Bid $6.60 $5.01 $5.96 $4.00 $5.40 No Bid

149 1" Gate Valve (Hand) Brass No Bid No Bid $10.39 $7.44 $8.93 $7.00 $7.29 No Bid

150 2" Gate Valve (Hand) Brass No Bid No Bid $28.22 $20.31 $23.66 $20.00 $21.42 No Bid

151
Square Point Open Back 

Blade 48" Oak Handle
$17.90 $29.00 $24.00 $21.33 No Bid $25.00 No Bid No Bid

152
Round Point Open Back 

Blade 48" Oak Handle 
$17.90 $29.00 $24.00 $21.00 No Bid $28.00 No Bid No Bid

153

Fiberglass Closed Back 

Drain Spade Long Handle 

#47-602 

$33.85 $39.00 No Bid $35.50 No Bid $27.00 No Bid No Bid

154
Fiberglass Handle Forged 

Bow Rake #63-184 
$25.81 $39.00 No Bid $34.61 No Bid $28.00 No Bid No Bid

155
Wooden Oak Handle Bush 

Axe
$49.00 $39.00 No Bid $44.33 No Bid $45.00 No Bid No Bid

156
Fiberglass Handle Double 

Face Axe $32.31 $33.00 No Bid $25.06 No Bid $33.00 No Bid No Bid

157 6" M.J. Elbows 45 No Bid No Bid $120.42 $50.58 No Bid $48.00 $114.40 No Bid

158 8" M.J. Elbows 221/2 No Bid No Bid $165.00 $71.74 No Bid $68.00 $156.75 No Bid

159 8" M.J. Elbows 45 No Bid No Bid $120.42 $73.81 No Bid $70.00 $158.40 No Bid

160 8" M.J. Elbows 90 No Bid No Bid $183.53 $91.35 No Bid $87.00 $174.35 No Bid

161 10" M.J. Elbow 45 No Bid No Bid $222.89 $107.35 No Bid $102.00 $211.75 No Bid

162 10" M.J. Elbow 90 No Bid No Bid $258.21 $144.52 No Bid $139.00 $245.30 No Bid

163 6" x 6" x 6" M.J. Tee No Bid No Bid $158.63 $90.84 No Bid $87.00 $150.70 No Bid

M.J. Elbows and Tee's (Epoxy 

Pipe: Galvanized, PVC and Copper 

Tools  Miscellaneous Parts

The following items listed are Razor 
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Bid Item #12-066

Warehouse Inventory Supplies

for the City of Augusta - Utilities Department

Bid Due:  Wednesday, November 9, 2011 @ 11:00 a.m.

WAREHOUSE - WYLDS ROAD

Toole Supply

1605 Hartrich Rd

Augusta, GA 30909

E T Industrial Supply

P. O. Box 9201

Augusta, GA 30916

HD Supply 

Waterworks

3620 Milledgeville Rd

Augusta, GA 30909

Independent 

Waterworks

221 Laurel Road

Lexington, SC 29073

Consolidated Pipe

1241 Fairgrounds 

Madison, GA 30650

Atlantic Supply

1628 Barton Chapel 

Rd

Augusta, GA 30909

Ferguson 

Waterworks

702 McKnight 

Industrial

Augusta, GA 30907

Homeland

214 Florida Ave

New Smyrna Bea, FL 

32169

164 8" x 8" x 8" M.J. Tee No Bid No Bid $225.79 $135.74 No Bid $129.00 $214.50 No Bid

165 6" M.J. Elbow 22 ½” No Bid No Bid $116.37 $46.45 No Bid $44.00 $110.55 No Bid

166 1” x 24 ¾” Adjustable Ring No Bid No Bid No Bid $150.00 No Bid $95.00 No Bid No Bid

167 2” x 24 ¾” Adjustable Ring No Bid No Bid No Bid $175.00 No Bid $99.00 No Bid No Bid

168
6" x 6" M.J. Tapping Sleeve 

For Cast Iron
No Bid No Bid $641.59 $435.61 No Bid $435.61 $465.30 No Bid

169
8" x 6" M.J. Tapping Sleeve 

For Cast Iron
No Bid No Bid $788.03 $538.15 No Bid $520.00 $571.45 No Bid

170
8” x 4”  M.J. Tapping Sleeve 

For Cast Iron
No Bid No Bid $788.03 $538.15 No Bid $520.00 $571.45 No Bid

171 8” x 4”  M.J. Tapping Sleeve 

For AC (epoxy coated)

No Bid No Bid No Bid $538.15 No Bid $1,317.30 $571.45 No Bid

172 12” x 6”  M.J. Tapping Sleeve 

For CI/DI (epoxy coated)

No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,059.78 No Bid $1,479.70 $1,130.25 No Bid

173 14” x 6”  M.J. Tapping Sleeve 

For CI/DI (epoxy coated)
No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,378.49 No Bid $1,496.80 $3,438.44 No Bid

174
6" Mega Lug (for Ductile 

Pipe) Packs  w/acc
No Bid No Bid $29.23 $26.47 No Bid $25.67 $30.97 No Bid

175
8" Mega Lug (for Ductile 

Pipe) Packs  w/acc
No Bid No Bid $39.71 $36.05 No Bid $34.95 $42.08 No Bid

176
12” Mega Lug (for Ductile 

Pipe) Packs  w/acc
No Bid No Bid $76.14 $71.48 No Bid $69.30 $80.68 No Bid

177
16" Mega Lug (for PVC Pipe) 

Packs  w/acc
No Bid No Bid $131.41 $165.75 No Bid $160.68 $139.26 No Bid

178
6" Mega Lug (for PVC Pipe) 

Packs  w/acc
No Bid No Bid $34.08 $30.73 No Bid $29.79 $36.11 No Bid

179
 8” Mega Lug (for PVC Pipe) 

Packs  w/acc
No Bid No Bid $35.25 $42.27 No Bid $40.98 $48.82 No Bid

180
 4” Mega Lug (for PVC Pipe) 

Packs  w/acc
No Bid No Bid $27.03 $24.60 No Bid $23.85 $28.64 No Bid

181
 4” Mega Lug (for Ductile 

Pipe) Packs  w/acc
No Bid No Bid $23.56 $21.51 No Bid $20.85 $24.97 No Bid

182
 3” Mega Lug (for Ductile 

Pipe) Packs  w/acc
No Bid No Bid $21.82 $21.51 No Bid $20.85 $23.14 No Bid

183
Safety Flange Kit /f M&H 5 ¼  

Fire Hydrant
No Bid No Bid $94.97 $70.15 No Bid $70.15 $109.13 No Bid

184
Safety Flange Kit /f M&H  4 

1/2 Fire Hydrant
No Bid No Bid $94.97 $70.15 No Bid $70.15 $95.57 No Bid

185
Safety Flange Kit /f MU  5 1/4 

Fire Hydrant
No Bid No Bid $108.49 $90.19 No Bid $90.19 No Bid No Bid

186
Safety Flange Kit /f MU  4 1/2 

Fire Hydrant No Bid No Bid $108.49 $85.18 No Bid $85.18 No Bid No Bid

187
Safety Flange Kit /f AVK  5 

1/4 Fire Hydrant
No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.26 No Bid $75.26 No Bid No Bid

ANTI TERRORIST DEVICE 

KITS

188
AVK Model 5.25" Kit OL 

Vented Stem
No Bid No Bid $575.00 $574.00 No Bid $560.00 $675.00 $590.00

189
M&H Model 5.25" Kit OL 

Vented Stem
No Bid No Bid $575.52 $574.00 No Bid $560.00 $675.00 $590.00

190

Mueller Centurion Model 

5.25" Post 1986 Kit OL 

Vented St
No Bid No Bid $574.81 $574.00 No Bid $560.00 $675.00 $590.00

191

Mueller Centurion Model 

5.25" Pre-1987 Kit OL Vented 

St
No Bid No Bid $575.00 $574.00 No Bid $560.00 $675.00 $590.00

192
American Darling B62B's 

5.25 Kit OL Vented Stem
No Bid No Bid $575.00 $574.00 No Bid $560.00 $675.00 $590.00

193
M&H  5 1/4 Fire Hydrant Ext 

12”  
No Bid No Bid $350.66 $207.66 No Bid $190.00 $285.20 No Bid

194
M&H  5 1/4 Fire Hydrant Ext 

18”
No Bid No Bid $397.92 $237.98 No Bid $224.00 $323.64 No Bid

195
M&H  5 1/4 Fire Hydrant Ext 

24”
No Bid No Bid $432.23 $263.75 No Bid $248.00 $351.54 No Bid

196
MU  5 1/4 Fire Hydrant Ext 

12”
No Bid No Bid $387.72 $207.66 No Bid $245.00 No Bid No Bid

197
MU  5 1/4 Fire Hydrant Ext 

18”
No Bid No Bid $439.09 $237.98 No Bid $275.00 No Bid No Bid

198
MU  5 1/4 Fire Hydrant Ext 

24”
No Bid No Bid $494.13 $263.75 No Bid $310.00 No Bid No Bid

199
AVK 5 1/4 Fire Hydrant Ext 

12”
No Bid No Bid No Bid $196.13 No Bid $195.00 No Bid No Bid

200
AVK 5 1/4 Fire Hydrant Ext 

18”
No Bid No Bid No Bid $224.76 No Bid $224.00 No Bid No Bid

201
AVK 5 1/4 Fire Hydrant Ext 

24”
No Bid No Bid No Bid $253.39 No Bid $250.00 No Bid No Bid

 Mega Lug for Cast Iron and PVC 

FIRE HYDRANT EXT.

 M.J. Tapping Sleeves C.I. and AC 
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Bid Item #12-066

Warehouse Inventory Supplies

for the City of Augusta - Utilities Department

Bid Due:  Wednesday, November 9, 2011 @ 11:00 a.m.

WAREHOUSE - WYLDS ROAD

Toole Supply

1605 Hartrich Rd

Augusta, GA 30909

E T Industrial Supply

P. O. Box 9201

Augusta, GA 30916

HD Supply 

Waterworks

3620 Milledgeville Rd

Augusta, GA 30909

Independent 

Waterworks

221 Laurel Road

Lexington, SC 29073

Consolidated Pipe

1241 Fairgrounds 

Madison, GA 30650

Atlantic Supply

1628 Barton Chapel 

Rd

Augusta, GA 30909

Ferguson 

Waterworks

702 McKnight 

Industrial

Augusta, GA 30907

Homeland

214 Florida Ave

New Smyrna Bea, FL 

32169

202
MU  4 1/2 Fire Hydrant Ext 

12”
No Bid No Bid $348.43 $212.21 No Bid $212.21 No Bid No Bid

203
M&H  4 1/2 Fire Hydrant Ext 

12”
No Bid No Bid $316.36 $197.05 No Bid $185.00 $257.30 No Bid

204
48" 5 1/4 x 48 Bury Fire 

Hydrant -Mueller Brand
No Bid No Bid $1,205.00 $1,452.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

205
48" 5 1/4 x 48 Bury Fire 

Hydrant -M&H Brand
No Bid No Bid $1,205.00 $1,251.32 No Bid $1,159.00 $1,251.72 No Bid

206
48" 5 1/4 x 48 Bury Fire 

Hydrant -AVK Brand
No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,464.23 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

207
36" 5 1/4 x 36 Bury Fire 

Hydrant -Mueller Brand
No Bid No Bid $1,155.00 $1,444.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

208
36" 5 1/4 x 36 Bury Fire 

Hydrant -M&H Brand
No Bid No Bid $1,155.00 $1,204.29 No Bid $1,105.00 $1,193.58 No Bid

209
36" 5 1/4 x 36 Bury Fire 

Hydrant -AVK Brand
No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,430.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

210
72" 5 1/4 x 72 Bury Fire 

Hydrant -Mueller Brand No Bid No Bid $1,320.00 $1,527.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

211
72" 5 1/4 x 72 Bury Fire 

Hydrant -M&H Brand No Bid No Bid $1,320.00 $1,344.78 No Bid $1,267.00 $1,385.91 No Bid

212
72" 5 1/4 x 72 Bury Fire 

Hydrant -AVK Brand
No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,594.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

213
Watts  1 Double Check Valve 

Assembly                                        
No Bid No Bid $91.84 $80.27 No Bid $80.27 $94.31 No Bid

214
Watts  1 1/2 Double Check 

Valve Assembly
No Bid No Bid $213.03 $210.88 No Bid $157.35 $172.03 No Bid

215
Watts  2 Double Check Valve 

Assembly
No Bid No Bid $190.72 $236.88 No Bid $187.80 $205.32 No Bid

216
Watts  1 Reduce Pressure 

Zone Assembly
No Bid No Bid $137.11 $159.24 No Bid $135.00 $147.61 No Bid

217
Watts  1 1/2 Reduce Pressure 

Zone Assembly
No Bid No Bid $248.45 $280.31 No Bid $244.60 $261.48 No Bid

218
Watts  2 Reduce Pressure 

Zone Assembly
No Bid No Bid $288.66 $310.56 No Bid $284.25 $310.76 No Bid

219
Watts  3 Reduce Pressure 

Zone Assembly No Bid No Bid $979.38 $1,253.15 No Bid $964.00 $1,062.15 No Bid

Total $186.39 $218.10 $26,724.24 $35,758.36 $1,666.33 $25,166.86 $25,315.84 $2,950.00

BACK FLOW DEVICES
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